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Dear Mom,

This Christmas, I  want to give you something
different -  the opportunity to share your l i fe
story,  in your own words.  This booklet is a
starting point for reflection before we sit
down together to record your memories,
experiences,  and wisdom.

Take your time with these prompts.  Feel free
to jot down notes,  or simply let them stir  your
memories.  There are no right or wrong
answers -  only your unique story.
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What was different about how you grew up
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How did your family celebrate holidays? Any
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Remember,  these questions are just the
beginning. There are so many stories you've
told me over the years,  and probably just as
many that I 've never heard. Every time we
talk,  I  learn something new about you, about
our family,  and about myself .

I  know some of these memories might make
you laugh, and others might bring tears.  Take
your time with them. Each story you share is
a gift -  not just to me, but to our whole family
and all  the generations to come.

I 'm looking forward to sitting down together,
taking our time, and really l istening to your
life story.  Thank you for being wil l ing to share
it with me.

All  my love,

Seth
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